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Demosthenes, the son of Demosthenes of Paeania in Attica, a rich and highly respected factory-owner, was
born in or about the year 384 B.C. He was early left an orphan; his guardians mismanaged his property for
their own advantage; and although, soon after coming of age in 366, he took proceedings against them and
was victorious in the law-courts, he appears to have recovered comparatively little from them. In preparing
for these proceedings he had the assistance of Isaeus, a teacher and writer of speeches who was remarkable
for his knowledge of law, his complete mastery of all the aspects of any case with which he had to do, and
his skill in dealing with questions of ownership and inheritance. Demosthenes’ speeches against his
guardians show plainly the influence of Isaeus, and the teacher may have developed in his pupil the
thoroughness and the ingenuity in handling legal arguments which afterwards became characteristic of his
work.
 
Apart from this litigation with his guardians, we know little of Demosthenes’ youth and early manhood.
Various stories have come down to us (for the most part not on the best authority), of his having been
inspired to aim at an orator’s career by the eloquence and fame of Callistratus; of his having overcome
serious physical defects by assiduous practice; of his having failed, nevertheless, owing to imperfections of
delivery, in his early appearances before the people, and having been enabled to remedy these by the
instruction of the celebrated actor Satyrus; and of his close study of the History of Thucydides. Upon the
latter point the evidence of his early style leaves no room for doubt, and the same studies may have
contributed to the skill and impressiveness with which, in nearly every oration, he appeals to the events of
the past, and sums up the lessons of history. Whether he came personally under the influence either of Plato,
the philosopher, or of Isocrates, the greatest rhetorical teacher of his time, and a political pamphleteer of high
principles but little practical insight, is much more doubtful. The two men were almost as different in
temperament and aims as it was possible to be, but Demosthenes’ familiarity with the published speeches of
Isocrates, and with the rhetorical principles which Isocrates taught and followed, can scarcely be questioned.
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From reader reviews:

Carlos White:

What do you think of book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people in
the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that concern above. Every person has
several personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pushed someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great and important the book The Public Orations of
Demosthenes, Volume 1. All type of book could you see on many methods. You can look for the internet
options or other social media.

Marvin Seto:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the extra time or they will
get great deal of stress from both daily life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have spare time, we
will say absolutely without a doubt. People is human not a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of
activity are there when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will unlimited right.
Then ever try this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative in spending your spare time, the
particular book you have read will be The Public Orations of Demosthenes, Volume 1.

Melissa Peterson:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
important than other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What
you have to do is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to experience a look at some books.
One of several books in the top record in your reading list is definitely The Public Orations of Demosthenes,
Volume 1. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Mountains can get you closer in growing to be
precious person. By looking way up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.

Bertha Greene:

Some people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt this when
they get a half areas of the book. You can choose often the book The Public Orations of Demosthenes,
Volume 1 to make your reading is interesting. Your own personal skill of reading expertise is developing
when you like reading. Try to choose straightforward book to make you enjoy to read it and mingle the
opinion about book and reading especially. It is to be 1st opinion for you to like to start a book and learn it.
Beside that the e-book The Public Orations of Demosthenes, Volume 1 can to be your friend when you're
really feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of that time.
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