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The Dutch Atlantic interrogates the Dutch involvement in Atlantic slavery and assesses the historical
consequences of this for contemporary European society.

Kwame Nimako and Glenn Willemsen show how the slave trade and slavery intertwined economic, social
and cultural elements, including nation-state formation in the Netherlands and across Europe. They explore
the mobilisation of European populations in the implementation of policies that facilitated Atlantic slavery
and examine how European countries created and expanded laws that perpetuated colonisation.

Addressing key themes such as the incorporation of the formerly enslaved into post-slavery states and
contemporary collective efforts to forget and/or remember slavery and its legacy in the Netherlands, this is
an essential text for students of European history and postcolonial studies.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Bradley:

This The Dutch Atlantic: Slavery, Abolition and Emancipation (Decolonial Studies, Postcolonial Horizons)
are generally reliable for you who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this The
Dutch Atlantic: Slavery, Abolition and Emancipation (Decolonial Studies, Postcolonial Horizons) can be
among the great books you must have is definitely giving you more than just simple examining food but feed
you actually with information that might be will shock your previous knowledge. This book will be handy,
you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed types. Beside
that this The Dutch Atlantic: Slavery, Abolition and Emancipation (Decolonial Studies, Postcolonial
Horizons) forcing you to have an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of
critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Arthur Poulsen:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get
great deal of stress from both day to day life and work. So , if we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we inquire again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to an individual of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the book you have
read is actually The Dutch Atlantic: Slavery, Abolition and Emancipation (Decolonial Studies, Postcolonial
Horizons).

Stephen Bruns:

Reading a book to be new life style in this year; every people loves to learn a book. When you study a book
you can get a great deal of benefit. When you read ebooks, you can improve your knowledge, simply
because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book
that you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education books, but
if you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, these kinds of us novel, comics, and also
soon. The The Dutch Atlantic: Slavery, Abolition and Emancipation (Decolonial Studies, Postcolonial
Horizons) will give you new experience in reading through a book.

Charles Steen:

With this era which is the greater person or who has ability to do something more are more important than
other. Do you want to become among it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you must do is just
spending your time not much but quite enough to experience a look at some books. One of many books in
the top checklist in your reading list will be The Dutch Atlantic: Slavery, Abolition and Emancipation
(Decolonial Studies, Postcolonial Horizons). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Inclines can
get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you can get many



advantages.
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