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This new book significantly contributes to an increased understanding of the gay and lesbian experience as it
illuminates important works of literature and clarifies the status of same-sex desire in English literature from
1500--1760. Homosexual themes can be found throughout the literature of the English Renaissance and
Enlightenment, but only rarely are they direct and unambiguous. The essays here are engaged in a vital and
necessary process of re-historicizing and re-contextualizing literature. Utilizing a variety of critical methods
and proceeding from several different theoretical and ideological presuppositions, these essays raise
important questions about the methodology of gay studies, about the conception of same-sex desire, about
the depiction of homoerotics, and about the relationship of sexuality and textuality, even as they shed new
light on the homosexual import of a number of significant works of literature. Among the authors studied are
Christopher Marlowe, William Shakespeare, John Donne, Lady Mary Wroth, Katherine Philips, Aphra Behn,
John Cleland, and Thomas Gray. The collection attests both the current intellectual ferment in gay studies
and the richness of English Renaissance and eighteenth-century literary representations of
homosexuality.Homosexuality in Renaissance and Enlightenment England provides numerous insights into
important works of literature and into significant theoretical issues implicit in the process of discerning and
defining homosexuality in texts of earlier ages. All the contributors locate their texts in carefully delineated
cultural and historical milieux. But they are not unduly constrained by either the tyranny of theory or the
anxieties of anachronism. Rather than proceeding from hidebound or fashionably current ideologies, they sift
the texts they study for the concrete evidence from which theories of sexuality might be constructed or
modified. Hence, the collection will be valuable both for its practical criticism and for its theoretical
contributions. It vividly illustrates the variety of gay studies in literature, especially as applied to works of
earlier ages.
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From reader reviews:

Jenny Dill:

Book is actually written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a
reserve. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important factor to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading talent was fluently. A reserve Homosexuality in Renaissance and
Enlightenment England: Literary Representations in Historical Context (Occupational Therapy in Health
Care Series) will make you to be smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about almost
everything. But some of you think in which open or reading a book make you bored. It isn't make you fun.
Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with you?

William Svendsen:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with friends is thing that
usually you may have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Homosexuality in Renaissance and
Enlightenment England: Literary Representations in Historical Context (Occupational Therapy in Health
Care Series), it is possible to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still would like to miss it? What
kind of hang type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't have it, oh come on its named
reading friends.

Christopher Larsen:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or just
laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Homosexuality in Renaissance and
Enlightenment England: Literary Representations in Historical Context (Occupational Therapy in Health
Care Series) can be the solution, oh how comes? The new book you know. You are consequently out of date,
spending your extra time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these
guides have than the others?

Concepcion Bass:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our understanding for everything. By a book we can know
everything you want. A book is a set of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year has been
exactly added. This book Homosexuality in Renaissance and Enlightenment England: Literary
Representations in Historical Context (Occupational Therapy in Health Care Series) was filled regarding
science. Spend your spare time to add your knowledge about your scientific disciplines competence. Some
people has distinct feel when they reading any book. If you know how big advantage of a book, you can
really feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book which you wanted.
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