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Lorraine Hansberry's A Raisin in the Sun (1959) was a major dramatic success and brought to the world's
attention the potential talent of African American women playwrights. But in spite of Hansberry's landmark
contribution, both the theater and the literary world have often failed to include contemporary African
American female playwrights within the circle of production, publication, and criticism. In African
American drama anthologies, female playwrights are seldom given the degree of attention that is accorded
their male counterparts. And because of space constraints, anthologies of works by women playwrights are
forced to exclude numerous female dramatists, including African Americans. Meanwhile, some scholars
have argued that the works of African American female playwrights are seldom produced in the mainstream
theater because these plays frequently challenge the views of white America. But as A Raisin in the Sun
demonstrates, plays by African American women dramatists can have a powerful message and are worthy of
attention.

A comprehensive research tool, this annotated bibliography sheds light on the often neglected works of
contemporary African American female playwrights. Included within its scope are those dramatists who
have had at least one work published since 1959, the year of Hansberry's monumental achievement. The first
section provides a listing of anthologies that include one or more plays written by an African American
female dramatist. The second gives entries for reference works and for scholarly and critical studies of the
dramatists and their plays. The third presents a listing of published plays by individual dramatists, along with
a summary of each drama; the works of each playwright that are related to drama; and secondary sources that
treat the dramatists and their plays. Entries are accompanied by concise but informative annotations, and the
volume closes with a list of periodicals that frequently publish criticism of African American female
playwrights, a section of brief biographical sketches of the dramatists, and extensive indexes.
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From reader reviews:

Rodney Sierra:

The reserve with title Contemporary African American Female Playwrights: An Annotated Bibliography
(Bibliographies and Indexes in Afro-American and African Studies) has lot of information that you can
understand it. You can get a lot of profit after read this book. That book exist new understanding the
information that exist in this reserve represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to
yo7u to know how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you with new era of the syndication.
You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the item anywhere you want.

Tina Olsen:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the coastal world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you will have done when you have spare time, then why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not sense tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you have
been ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Contemporary African American Female
Playwrights: An Annotated Bibliography (Bibliographies and Indexes in Afro-American and African
Studies), you may enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of
hang-out type is it? Oh can occur its mind hangout men. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its referred to as
reading friends.

Gregory Sims:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to select book like
comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not hoping Contemporary African
American Female Playwrights: An Annotated Bibliography (Bibliographies and Indexes in Afro-American
and African Studies) that give your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by simply reading this book.
Reading routine all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world considerably
better then how they react when it comes to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading practice
only for the geeky man or woman but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you
who want to start reading as your good habit, you can pick Contemporary African American Female
Playwrights: An Annotated Bibliography (Bibliographies and Indexes in Afro-American and African
Studies) become your personal starter.

Laura Crabtree:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This book Contemporary African American Female
Playwrights: An Annotated Bibliography (Bibliographies and Indexes in Afro-American and African
Studies) was bright colored and of course has pictures on there. As we know that book Contemporary
African American Female Playwrights: An Annotated Bibliography (Bibliographies and Indexes in Afro-



American and African Studies) has many kinds or variety. Start from kids until teens. For example Naruto or
Private eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. So , not at all of book are make
you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to
like reading this.
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