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In two dozen short, readable biographies of John Calvin’s friends — including some who turned into
enemies — Machiel A. van den Berg paints an intimate portrait of the great Reformer’s life and circle that
most of us have never seen. / Here we accompany Calvin from his early boyhood in Noyon to his student
days in Paris and Orleans, to his pastorate in and exile from Geneva, all the way to his deathbed. We meet
his famous Reformer friends — William Farel, Martin Bucer, Philip Melanchthon, Heinrich Bullinger, John
Knox, Theodore Beza — and friends whose names are more obscure: his cousin Pierre Robert Oliv?tan, the
first translator of the Bible into French; Ren?e de France of French royalty; Laurent de Normandie, the
mayor of Noyon who later escaped to Geneva; Pierre Viret, his “best friend of all”; and Idelette van Buren,
his beloved wife during their brief but happy marriage. / Calvin may be known as a scholar who preferred his
study to imperial and ecclesiastical politics, but he was also a rebel of faith against the papacy, which
controlled most of the empires of Europe and had a price on the heads of all “reform-minded” citizens,
especially their leaders. Peppered with quotations from Calvin’s voluminous letters, Friends of Calvin
abounds with secret court relationships, love affairs, death threats, poisonings, and narrow midnight escapes
from the pursuing authorities — showing a full-blooded and dangerous side of the bookish Reformer’s life.
Readers of these colorful narratives will come to see how much Calvin’s friends influenced his life and
thought. / “This work provides fresh and accessible insights into John Calvin’s inner circle. The highly
readable translation offers vignettes that show the Reformer’s capacity for deep and enduring relationships
with friends and family members.”— Karin Maag / H. Henry Meeter Center for Calvin Studies, Calvin
College and Seminary
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From reader reviews:

Nichole Gibson:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in each and every way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place and
notice simply by surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated the idea for a while
is reading. Yeah, by reading a e-book your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading the book, we give you this particular Friends of
Calvin book as beginner and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Sophia Morrison:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources included can be true or not demand people to be aware of each details they get. How many people
to be smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Studying a book can help men and women out of this uncertainty Information specifically this Friends of
Calvin book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of course the info in this book
hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Herbert Mikula:

Do you have something that that suits you such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to pick book
like comic, short story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not striving Friends of Calvin that give
your enjoyment preference will be satisfied by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world can be
said as the opportinity for people to know world a great deal better then how they react when it comes to the
world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman but for all of
you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start reading as your good
habit, you may pick Friends of Calvin become your own starter.

Jerry Ingle:

A lot of reserve has printed but it is different. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the top
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified as of book
Friends of Calvin. You can add your knowledge by it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your
knowledge and make anyone happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can
bring you from one spot to other place.
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