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Today, the ideas of Carl von Clausewitz (1780-1831) are employed almost ubiquitously in strategic studies,
military history and defence literatures, but often in a manner which distorts their true meaning. In this book,
Waldman explores Clausewitzâ€™s central theoretical device for understanding war - the â€˜remarkable
trinityâ€™ of politics, chance and passion. By situating the great Prussian in historical context, he presents a
conception truer to Clausewitzâ€™s intention. Seeking to achieve this through an in-depth reinterpretation of
On War and Clausewitzâ€™s other writings, conducted through the prism of the trinity, this book draws on
existing studies but argues that there is room for clarification. It presents fresh perspectives into aspects of
Clausewitz's thought and emphasises elements of his theory that have often been neglected. Furthermore, it
provides a solid basis from which debate on the nature of modern war can move forward.
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From reader reviews:

Deanna Reed:

This War, Clausewitz and the Trinity is great reserve for you because the content that is full of information
for you who also always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it
info accurately using great arrange word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read
that hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences
but difficult core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having War, Clausewitz and the Trinity in
your hand like getting the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no
reserve that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this e-book already do that. So , this really
is good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?

Jesse Mansell:

Many people spending their period by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day every day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book.
Ugh, do you consider reading a book can really hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It
okay you can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like War, Clausewitz and
the Trinity which is keeping the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's observe.

Helen Hanson:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why
so many query for the book? But almost any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
reading through, not only science book but also novel and War, Clausewitz and the Trinity as well as others
sources were given know-how for you. After you know how the fantastic a book, you feel would like to read
more and more. Science reserve was created for teacher or perhaps students especially. Those ebooks are
helping them to increase their knowledge. In additional case, beside science reserve, any other book likes
War, Clausewitz and the Trinity to make your spare time much more colorful. Many types of book like this.

Blanche Jackson:

Reading a e-book make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is composed or printed or illustrated from each source this filled update of news. On this
modern era like currently, many ways to get information are available for a person. From media social such
as newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You can add your
understanding by that book. Are you ready to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just searching for
the War, Clausewitz and the Trinity when you essential it?
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