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How to use brands to gain and sustain competitive advantage

Companies today face a dilemma in marketing. The tried-and-true formulas to create sales and market share
behind brands are becoming irrelevant and losing traction with consumers. In this book, Gerzema and LeBar
offer credible evidence--drawn from a detailed analysis of a decade's worth of brand and financial data using
Y&R's Brand Asset Valuator (BAV), the largest database of brands in the world--that business is riding on
yet another bubble that is ready to burst--a brand bubble. While most managers still see metrics like trust and
awareness as the backbone of how brands are built, Gerzema asserts they're dead wrong--these metrics do
not add to increased asset value. In fact, by following them, they actually hasten the declining value of their
brands.

Using a five-stage model, The Brand Bubble reveals how today's successful brands--and tomorrow's--have
an insatiable appetite for creativity and change. These brands offer consumers a palpable sense of movement
and direction thanks to a powerful "energized differentiation." Gerzema reveals how brands with energized
differentiation achieve better financial performance than traditional brands have. Plus, Gerzema helps
readers develop energized differentiation in their own brands, creating consumer-centric and sustainable
organizations.
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From reader reviews:

Thomas West:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have much more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity to get spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to often the Mall. How about open as well as read a book titled The Brand Bubble:
The Looming Crisis in Brand Value and How to Avoid It? Maybe it is to get best activity for you. You
recognize beside you can spend your time with the favorite's book, you can smarter than before. Do you
agree with the opinion or you have different opinion?

Donna Kerns:

The book The Brand Bubble: The Looming Crisis in Brand Value and How to Avoid It make one feel enjoy
for your spare time. You can use to make your capable considerably more increase. Book can to get your
best friend when you getting stress or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book
The Brand Bubble: The Looming Crisis in Brand Value and How to Avoid It being your habit, you can get
more advantages, like add your current capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects. You
can know everything if you like open up and read a reserve The Brand Bubble: The Looming Crisis in Brand
Value and How to Avoid It. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or
others. So , how do you think about this publication?

Donna Nichols:

This The Brand Bubble: The Looming Crisis in Brand Value and How to Avoid It are reliable for you who
want to certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this The Brand Bubble: The Looming
Crisis in Brand Value and How to Avoid It can be among the great books you must have is usually giving
you more than just simple reading food but feed an individual with information that might be will shock your
prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it just about everywhere and whenever your
conditions at e-book and printed people. Beside that this The Brand Bubble: The Looming Crisis in Brand
Value and How to Avoid It giving you an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo of
critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Karen Johnson:

The reason? Because this The Brand Bubble: The Looming Crisis in Brand Value and How to Avoid It is an
unordinary book that the inside of the guide waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it will distress you
with the secret the item inside. Reading this book alongside it was fantastic author who have write the book
in such amazing way makes the content inside easier to understand, entertaining technique but still convey
the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to
regret it. This book will give you a lot of advantages than the other book have got such as help improving
your proficiency and your critical thinking means. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I have



been you I will go to the reserve store hurriedly.
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