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As the Second World War drew to a close, European borders were being redrawn. The regions of Istria,
Dalmatia, and Venezia Giulia, nominally Italian but at various times also belonging to Austria and Germany,
fell under the rule of Yugoslavia and its dictator Marshal Tito. The ensuing removal and genocide of Italians
from these regions had been little explored or even discussed until 1999, when the esteemed Italian journalist
Arrigo Petacco wrote L'esodo: La tragedia negata degli italiani d'Istria, Dalmazia e Venezia Giulia. Now
this story is available in English as A Tragedy Revealed.

Petacco explains the history of the regions and how they were shifted between empires for centuries. The
greater part of the story however details the genocidal program of the Yugoslav Communist government
toward the native Italians in the regions. Based on previously unavailable archival documents and oral
accounts from people who were there, Petacco reveals the events and exposes the Italian government's
mishandling – and then official silence on – the situation. This is a riveting work on a little-known, tragic
event written by one of Italy's most highly regarded journalists.
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From reader reviews:

Juan Higgins:

In other case, little persons like to read book A Tragedy Revealed: The Story of Italians from Istria,
Dalmatia, and Venezia Giulia, 1943-1956 (Toronto Italian Studies). You can choose the best book if you
love reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book A Tragedy Revealed:
The Story of Italians from Istria, Dalmatia, and Venezia Giulia, 1943-1956 (Toronto Italian Studies). You
can add know-how and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, because from
book you can understand everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will find
yourself known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a
book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You should use it when you feel bored to go
to the library. Let's read.

Timothy Roesch:

Now a day people that Living in the era wherever everything reachable by match the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not call for people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in obtaining any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book can
help persons out of this uncertainty Information specially this A Tragedy Revealed: The Story of Italians
from Istria, Dalmatia, and Venezia Giulia, 1943-1956 (Toronto Italian Studies) book since this book offers
you rich information and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred % guarantees there is no
doubt in it you may already know.

Kenneth Allen:

The particular book A Tragedy Revealed: The Story of Italians from Istria, Dalmatia, and Venezia Giulia,
1943-1956 (Toronto Italian Studies) has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of
advantage. The book was written by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research
previous to write this book. This specific book very easy to read you will get the point easily after scanning
this book.

Patricia Howland:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by simply watching television programs or just
resting on the bed? Do you need something new? This A Tragedy Revealed: The Story of Italians from Istria,
Dalmatia, and Venezia Giulia, 1943-1956 (Toronto Italian Studies) can be the response, oh how comes? It's a
book you know. You are so out of date, spending your extra time by reading in this brand new era is
common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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