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One bad boy. One good girl. One unforgettable week.

Angelle Prejean is in a pickle. Her family is expecting her to come home with a fiancé--a fiancé who doesn't
exist. Well, he exists, but he definitely has no idea Angelle told her mama they were engaged. Tattooed,
muscled, and hotter than sin, Cane can reduce Angelle to a hot mess with one look--and leave her heart a
mess if she falls for him. But when she ends up winning him at a charity bachelor auction, she knows just
how to solve her fiancé problem.

Cane Robicheaux is no one's prince. He doesn't do relationships and he doesn't fall in love. When sweet,
sultry-voiced Angelle propositions him, he hopes their little fiancé game can finally get her out of his head.
He doesn't expect her to break through all his barriers. But even as Angelle burrows deeper into his heart, he
knows once their seven days are up, so is their ruse.

Love & Games Series 
Taste the Heat (Book #1 - Jason & Colby)
Seven Day Fiance (Book #2 - Cane & Angelle) 
Accidentally Married on Purpose (Book #3 - Sherry & Tyler)
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From reader reviews:

Nellie Ferguson:

Often the book Seven Day Fiancé: A Love and Games Novel has a lot associated with on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was published by the very famous author.
The author makes some research previous to write this book. This particular book very easy to read you may
get the point easily after looking over this book.

Michael Berry:

Reading can called brain hangout, why? Because when you are reading a book mainly book entitled Seven
Day Fiancé: A Love and Games Novel your head will drift away trough every dimension, wandering in each
aspect that maybe not known for but surely can become your mind friends. Imaging each word written in a
e-book then become one type conclusion and explanation this maybe you never get previous to. The Seven
Day Fiancé: A Love and Games Novel giving you another experience more than blown away the mind but
also giving you useful data for your better life within this era. So now let us teach you the relaxing pattern
here is your body and mind is going to be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a. Do you
want to try this extraordinary wasting spare time activity?

Carey Gilliam:

You can find this Seven Day Fiancé: A Love and Games Novel by browse the bookstore or Mall. Merely
viewing or reviewing it could possibly to be your solve challenge if you get difficulties to your knowledge.
Kinds of this publication are various. Not only by simply written or printed but additionally can you enjoy
this book by simply e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking by your mobile phone and
searching what your problem. Right now, choose your personal ways to get more information about your e-
book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still revise. Let's try to choose
suitable ways for you.

Daniel Bryant:

Some people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half portions of the book. You can choose often the book Seven Day Fiancé: A Love and Games
Novel to make your current reading is interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you
like reading. Try to choose basic book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the idea about book and
reading especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to wide open a book and learn it. Beside that the
publication Seven Day Fiancé: A Love and Games Novel can to be a newly purchased friend when you're
really feel alone and confuse in doing what must you're doing of this time.
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