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Organic chemistry has played a vital role in the development of diverse molecules which are used in
medicines, agrochemicals and polymers. Most ofthe chemicals are produced on an industrial scale. The
industrial houses adopt a synthesis for a particular molecule which should be cost-effective. No attention is
paid to avoid the release of harmful chemicals in the atmosphere, land and sea. During the past decade
special emphasis has been made towards green synthesis which circumvents the above problems. Prof. V. K.
Ahluwalia and Dr. M. Kidwai have made a sincere effort in this direction. This book discusses the basic
principles of green chemistry incorporating the use of green reagents, green catalysts, phase transfer
catalysis, green synthesis using microwaves, ultrasound and biocatalysis in detail. Special emphasis is given
to liquid phase reactions and organic synthesis in the solid phase. I must congratulate both the authors for
their pioneering efforts to write this book. Careful selection of various topics in the book will serve the
rightful purpose for the chemistry community and the industrial houses at all levels. PROF. JAVED IQBAL,
PhD, FNA Distinguished Research Scientist & Head Discovery Research Dr. Reddy's Laboratories Ltd.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Fleeman:

With other case, little men and women like to read book New Trends in Green Chemistry. You can choose
the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a book New
Trends in Green Chemistry. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by just a book.
Absolutely right, because from book you can recognize everything! From your country until foreign or
abroad you can be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we
could open a book or perhaps searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You need to use it when you
feel fed up to go to the library. Let's study.

Linda Manning:

Book is definitely written, printed, or created for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
publication. Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Alongside that you can your reading proficiency was fluently. A publication New Trends in Green
Chemistry will make you to possibly be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can
know about everything. But some of you think in which open or reading the book make you bored. It is not
necessarily make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or suited
book with you?

Becky Duncan:

Nowadays reading books be than want or need but also turn into a life style. This reading practice give you
lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the particular information inside the book in
which improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on what kind of book you
read, if you want get more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want experience
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The New Trends in Green Chemistry is
kind of publication which is giving the reader erratic experience.

Leah Humphries:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library or to
make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to at this time there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring along with can't see
colorful images on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important to suit your needs. As we
know that on this age, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, many ways to reach
Chinese's country. Therefore this New Trends in Green Chemistry can make you truly feel more interested to
read.
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