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In terms of celebrity icons, few attained the highest levels of fame and controversy as rapidly as Mae West.
Labeled a "pornographer" by censorship boards, she was also one of 1930s Hollywood's most lucrative box-
office draws (causing "Variety" in 1933 to label the star "as hot an issue as Hitler"). Nicknamed by critic
George Jean Nathan "the Statue of Libido" and paid homage to in the title song of Cole Porter's musical
Anything Goes, her voluptuous image and signature platinum blond air became recognizable worldwide and
for decades beyond her prime years of fame in the 1930s. In fact, even by the 1960s when the Beatles wanted
to use her image on the cover of their Sgt. Pepper's Lonely Hearts Club Band album, those long-haired icons
of a new generation were required to deliver a handwritten plea to the icon (which they dutifully did), since
West herself always objected, as she said, to belonging to any "lonely hearts club."In the "Movie Icon
Series", people talk about Hollywood glamour, about studios that had more stars than there are in heaven,
about actors who weren't actors but were icons. Other people talk about these things, "Taschen" shows you.
"Movie Icons" is a series of photo books that feature the most famous personalities in the history of cinema.
These 192-page books are visual biographies of the stars. For each title, series editor Paul Duncan has
painstaking selected approximately 150 high quality enigmatic and sumptuous portraits, colorful posters and
lobby cards, rare film stills, and previously unpublished candid photos showing the stars as they really are.
These images are accompanied by concise introductory essays by leading film writers; each book also
includes a chronology, a filmography, and a bibliography, and is peppered with apposite quotes from the
movies and from life.More bang for your buck! "...a fast-food, high-energy fix on the topic at hand." - "The
New York Times Book Review".
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From reader reviews:

Cynthia Johnson:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to ready your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite guide and reading a reserve. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can add
your knowledge by the e-book entitled Mae West (Movie Icons). Try to stumble through book Mae West
(Movie Icons) as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you sense alone and
beside that of course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very fortuned for you personally. The
book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know anything by the book. So , we should make
new experience as well as knowledge with this book.

Tyler Emery:

The e-book untitled Mae West (Movie Icons) is the publication that recommended to you to see. You can see
the quality of the guide content that will be shown to an individual. The language that writer use to explained
their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of research when write the
book, to ensure the information that they share for your requirements is absolutely accurate. You also might
get the e-book of Mae West (Movie Icons) from the publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Jordan Miller:

As we know that book is essential thing to add our expertise for everything. By a guide we can know
everything you want. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or even blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This publication Mae West (Movie Icons) was filled in relation to science. Spend your extra
time to add your knowledge about your science competence. Some people has distinct feel when they
reading a new book. If you know how big benefit of a book, you can experience enjoy to read a e-book. In
the modern era like currently, many ways to get book which you wanted.

Sherry Francis:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher asked them to go to the
library or even make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's
heart and soul or real their passion. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to the library. They go
to there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring in addition to
can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you
personally. As we know that on this time, many ways to get whatever we wish. Likewise word says, ways to
reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Mae West (Movie Icons) can make you sense more interested to
read.
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