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Learn how to conduct thorough security examinations via illustrations and virtual simulations

A network security breach (a hack, crack, or other invasion) occurs when unauthorized access to the network
is achieved and havoc results. The best possible defense is an offensive strategy that allows you to regularly
test your network to reveal the vulnerabilities and close the holes before someone gets in. Written by veteran
author and security expert John Chirillo, Hack Attacks Testing explains how to perform your own security
audits.

Step by step, the book covers how-to drilldowns for installing and configuring your Tiger Box operating
systems, installations, and configurations for some of the most popular auditing software suites. In addition,
it includes both common and custom usages, scanning methods, and reporting routines of each. Finally,
Chirillo inspects the individual vulnerability scanner results and compares them in an evaluation matrix
against a select group of intentional security holes on a target network. Chirillo tackles such topics as:

Building a multisystem Tiger Box●

Basic Windows 2000 Server installation and configuration for auditing●

Basic Linux and Solaris installation and configuration●

Basic Mac OS X installation and configuration for auditing●

ISS, CyberCop, Nessus, SAINT, and STAT scanners●

Using security analysis tools for Mac OS X●

Vulnerability assessment●

Bonus CD!
The CD contains virtual simulations of scanners, ISS Internet Scanner evaluation version, and more.
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From reader reviews:

Linda Enders:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. We all know that that
book is very important for all of us. The book Hack Attacks Testing: How to Conduct Your Own Security
Audit was making you to know about other information and of course you can take more information. It
doesn't matter what advantages for you. The e-book Hack Attacks Testing: How to Conduct Your Own
Security Audit is not only giving you far more new information but also to get your friend when you really
feel bored. You can spend your own personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while
using book Hack Attacks Testing: How to Conduct Your Own Security Audit. You never truly feel lose out
for everything when you read some books.

Bruce Brown:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated this for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive boost then having chance to endure than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this specific Hack Attacks
Testing: How to Conduct Your Own Security Audit book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because
this book is usually more than just a book.

Sara Pacheco:

The guide untitled Hack Attacks Testing: How to Conduct Your Own Security Audit is the book that
recommended to you you just read. You can see the quality of the book content that will be shown to an
individual. The language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article author
was did a lot of exploration when write the book, so the information that they share to you personally is
absolutely accurate. You also could get the e-book of Hack Attacks Testing: How to Conduct Your Own
Security Audit from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

Kimberly Johnson:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your short period of time to read it because all this time you only find book that
need more time to be go through. Hack Attacks Testing: How to Conduct Your Own Security Audit can be
your answer as it can be read by a person who have those short spare time problems.
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