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When was the last time you wrote a letter? Or received one in the mail?

These days, it’s so easy to dash off a quick e-mail or text message or make a cell- phone call while you’re on
the run that you may rarely make time for letter writing. But letters are a time-honored form of connection
that simply cannot be equaled or replaced by faster methods of communication.

The Art of the Personal Letter reclaims this lost art, giving you the gift of leisurely expression and allowing
you to write beautiful, enduring letters to the people you care about—be it by hand or on a computer. For any
occasion—whether you’re reaching out to connect with a long-lost friend or you want to express
condolences with grace—author Margaret Shepherd gives you both the inspiration and the tools to write a
memorable and meaningful letter that will be cherished by its recipient for years.

Filled with marvelous examples of common types of letters, The Art of the Personal Letter provides helpful
guidelines to enhance your unique voice and inspire you to start that holiday letter or difficult letter of
apology. From choosing just the right words, the right stationery, and even the right pen or font, you’ll learn
everything you need to know about the timeless art of the personal letter.
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From reader reviews:

Heather Reader:

As people who live in the actual modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even knowledge
to make these keep up with the era that is always change and make progress. Some of you maybe will
certainly update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know what type you should start with. This The Art of the Personal Letter: A Guide
to Connecting Through the Written Word is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why,
as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Janelle Coe:

The ability that you get from The Art of the Personal Letter: A Guide to Connecting Through the Written
Word may be the more deep you excavating the information that hide inside the words the more you get
interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to comprehend but The Art of the Personal
Letter: A Guide to Connecting Through the Written Word giving you excitement feeling of reading. The
writer conveys their point in a number of way that can be understood by anyone who read this because the
author of this guide is well-known enough. This particular book also makes your own vocabulary increase
well. It is therefore easy to understand then can go with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We
propose you for having this kind of The Art of the Personal Letter: A Guide to Connecting Through the
Written Word instantly.

Jonathan Bean:

Information is provisions for people to get better life, information nowadays can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a knowledge or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now's taking
seriously which one is appropriate to believe or which one the particular resource are convinced. If you get
the unstable resource then you get it as your main information you will see huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take The Art of the Personal Letter: A Guide to
Connecting Through the Written Word as the daily resource information.

April Baker:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get great deal
of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not only a robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, typically the
book you have read will be The Art of the Personal Letter: A Guide to Connecting Through the Written
Word.
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