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Mary Ann Rivers continues her Burnside family series—perfect for readers of Kristan Higgins, Jill
Shalvis, and Ruthie Knox—as two people try to share their hearts without losing their cool.
 
Dr. Sam Burnside is convinced that volunteering at an urban green-space farm in Lakefield, Ohio, is a waste
of time—especially with his new health clinic about to open. He only goes to mollify his partner, suspecting
she wants him to lighten up. Then Sam catches sight of Nina Paz, a woman who gives off more heat than a
scorcher in July. Her easy smile and flirty, sizzling wit has him forgetting his infamous need for control.
 
Widowed when her husband was killed in Afghanistan, Nina has learned that life exists to take chances. As
the daughter of migrant workers turned organic farmers, she’s built an exciting and successful business by
valuing new opportunities and working hard to take care of her own. But when Sam pushes for a relationship
that goes beyond their hotter-than-fire escapades, Nina ignores her own hard-won wisdom. She isn’t ready
for a man who needs saving—even if her heart compels her to take the greatest risk of all: love.

Praise for Laugh
 
“Amazing . . . one hell of a journey for a single book.”—Never Too Fond of Books
 
“The humor, emphasis on community, and passionate feeling make [Laugh] a lovely read.”—Dear Author
 
“Laugh makes you want to go out and take life by the horns, hug your friends and family tight and, yes . . .
laugh.”—For What It’s Worth
 
“If you want to read superb quality writing, be challenged intellectually and emotionally and be stimulated
sensually—Mary Ann Rivers is the author to grab! Trust me on this!”—Ripe for Reader
 
“Sam is my new favorite [May Ann Rivers] leading man. And trust me, when you read this you’ll know he’s
all man.”—The Book Hammock

“I love the Burnside family dynamic in this series—it’s messy and real.”—Red Hot and Blue Reads
 
“Mary Ann Rivers has the ability to take my breath away and make me laugh in the same paragraph . . .
heck, maybe even the same sentence.”—Straight Shootin’ Book Reviews
 
“One of the most achingly real love stories that I’ve ever read.”—Love at First Page
 
“Mary Ann Rivers is an author I trust implicitly. She unfailingly delivers stories with such realism. . . . She
delivers the romance that is best experienced in the quiet moments between two people falling in love, or
who are already there. It’s gritty and tough and messy. It’s beautiful.”—The Bookish Babe
 
Includes a special message from the editor, as well as an excerpt from another Loveswept title.
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From reader reviews:

Elizabeth Murphy:

Book is to be different for each and every grade. Book for children till adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important normally. The book Laugh: A Burnside Novel was making you to
know about other understanding and of course you can take more information. It is very advantages for you.
The guide Laugh: A Burnside Novel is not only giving you far more new information but also being your
friend when you truly feel bored. You can spend your spend time to read your reserve. Try to make
relationship together with the book Laugh: A Burnside Novel. You never sense lose out for everything in the
event you read some books.

Kathleen Young:

The knowledge that you get from Laugh: A Burnside Novel may be the more deep you digging the
information that hide inside words the more you get serious about reading it. It doesn't mean that this book is
hard to comprehend but Laugh: A Burnside Novel giving you joy feeling of reading. The copy writer
conveys their point in specific way that can be understood simply by anyone who read the idea because the
author of this reserve is well-known enough. This kind of book also makes your own personal vocabulary
increase well. So it is easy to understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are
available. We recommend you for having this kind of Laugh: A Burnside Novel instantly.

Nicolas Dandrea:

Information is provisions for those to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even restricted. What people must be
consider when those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking
seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen in you if you take Laugh: A Burnside Novel as your daily resource
information.

Ralph Rodriguez:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you could
have it in e-book approach, more simple and reachable. This kind of Laugh: A Burnside Novel can give you
a lot of buddies because by you looking at this one book you have thing that they don't and make you
actually more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you to get success. This
guide offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more than different make
you to be great persons. So , why hesitate? Let me have Laugh: A Burnside Novel.
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