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Winner of the Plutarch Award for the Best Biography of 2013

A mesmerizing and essential biography of the modernist poet Marianne Moore

The Marianne Moore that survives in the popular imagination is dignified, white-haired, and demure in her
tricorne hat; she lives with her mother until the latter's death; she maintains meaningful friendships with
fellow poets but never marries or falls in love.
Linda Leavell's Holding On Upside Down—the first biography of this major American poet written with the
support of the Moore estate—delves beneath the surface of this calcified image to reveal a passionate, canny
woman caught between genuine devotion to her mother and an irrepressible desire for personal autonomy
and freedom. Her many poems about survival are not just quirky nature studies but acts of survival
themselves.
Not only did the young poet join the Greenwich Village artists and writers who wanted to overthrow all her
mother's pieties but she also won their admiration for the radical originality of her language and the technical
proficiency of her verse. After her mother's death thirty years later, the aging recluse transformed herself,
against all expectations, into a charismatic performer and beloved celebrity. She won virtually every literary
prize available to her and was widely hailed as America's greatest living poet.
Elegantly written, meticulously researched, critically acute, and psychologically nuanced, Holding On
Upside Down provides at last the biography that this major poet and complex personality deserves.
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From reader reviews:

Lavelle Hildreth:

This Holding On Upside Down: The Life and Work of Marianne Moore are usually reliable for you who
want to certainly be a successful person, why. The key reason why of this Holding On Upside Down: The
Life and Work of Marianne Moore can be one of many great books you must have is giving you more than
just simple examining food but feed anyone with information that might be will shock your previous
knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-book
and printed people. Beside that this Holding On Upside Down: The Life and Work of Marianne Moore
giving you an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you demo of critical thinking that
we realize it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and revel in reading.

Robert Caceres:

The particular book Holding On Upside Down: The Life and Work of Marianne Moore will bring one to the
new experience of reading a new book. The author style to describe the idea is very unique. Should you try
to find new book you just read, this book very suited to you. The book Holding On Upside Down: The Life
and Work of Marianne Moore is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-book from the
official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Aaron Ryan:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them household
or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent many people free time just watching TV, as well
as playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can
read a book. It is really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day
long to reading a reserve. The book Holding On Upside Down: The Life and Work of Marianne Moore it is
quite good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended this book. These people were enjoying
reading this book. When you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy the e-book. You can
m0ore easily to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this book possesses
high quality.

Bernard Walker:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you may have done when you have spare time, and then why you don't try point that really opposite from
that. One activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you already
been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Holding On Upside Down: The Life and Work
of Marianne Moore, you can enjoy both. It is excellent combination right, you still wish to miss it? What
kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its
named reading friends.
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