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In academia, the mantra "publish or perish" is more than a cliche. In most humanities fields, securing tenure
proves impossible without at least one book under your belt. Yet despite the obvious importance of academic
publishing, the process remains an enigma to most young scholars. In this helpful guide, a seasoned author
offers essential advice for novice academic writers seeking publication. He explains why not all publications
are equal, why e-books are not as widely respected as printed books in the academic world, how to schedule
publications prior to tenure, how to spot a publishable idea, how to approach the right publisher, and a host
of other useful tips that greatly increase one's chances of publication. By outlining a step-by-step approach to
publishing, this indispensable manual removes much of the mystery surrounding an essential component of
an academic career.
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From reader reviews:

Cary Barrett:

What do you think about book? It is just for students because they are still students or the item for all people
in the world, what best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that question above. Every person
has several personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be compelled someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book Getting Published in the
Humanities: What to Know, Where to Aim, How to Succeed. All type of book are you able to see on many
sources. You can look for the internet methods or other social media.

Phyllis Greenfield:

Hey guys, do you really wants to finds a new book to read? May be the book with the concept Getting
Published in the Humanities: What to Know, Where to Aim, How to Succeed suitable to you? Typically the
book was written by popular writer in this era. The particular book untitled Getting Published in the
Humanities: What to Know, Where to Aim, How to Succeedis the main one of several books that will
everyone read now. That book was inspired many people in the world. When you read this guide you will
enter the new dimensions that you ever know before. The author explained their thought in the simple way,
thus all of people can easily to recognise the core of this book. This book will give you a great deal of
information about this world now. To help you see the represented of the world in this particular book.

Rachel Chaney:

The guide with title Getting Published in the Humanities: What to Know, Where to Aim, How to Succeed
has a lot of information that you can understand it. You can get a lot of gain after read this book. This
particular book exist new information the information that exist in this book represented the condition of the
world today. That is important to yo7u to learn how the improvement of the world. This book will bring you
in new era of the internationalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read it
anywhere you want.

Carol Williams:

The book untitled Getting Published in the Humanities: What to Know, Where to Aim, How to Succeed
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains your ex idea with easy means. The language is very
clear and understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read it. The book was
compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the new era of literary works. You can easily read
this book because you can read more your smart phone, or gadget, so you can read the book inside anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can wide open their official web-site as well as order it.
Have a nice go through.
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