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"[Mr. Lemoine's] desserts . . . verge on spectacular."
--The New York Times

Whip up a quick dessert to celebrate Coconut Torte Day on March 13!●

Stock up on vermouth to celebrate Dry Martini Day on June 19!●

Up for fried seafood? October 2 is National Fried Scallops Day!●

With this fabulously fun cookbook, every day is a holiday--that is, a national food holiday!

In this book, acclaimed chef and Food Network competitor Yvan D. Lemoine shares recipes with a
trademark exuberance that invites you to the party! You'll be treated to interesting food trivia alongside easy-
to-follow instructions for how to make such mouthwatering goodies as Salted Caramel Popcorn (for Popcorn
Day, January 19), Almond Madeleines (for Almond Day, February 16), Spinach and Artichoke Dip (for
Artichoke Heart Day, March 16), and many more for each month that follows.

Packed with a refreshing, random mix of recipes associated with each day of the year and festive full-color
photos throughout, this delightfully uncommon cookbook is sure to tempt the tastebuds of foodies and free-
spirits alike!
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From reader reviews:

Jesus Puga:

The book FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday Cookbook can give more knowledge and also the
precise product information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a good thing like a book
FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday Cookbook? Some of you have a different opinion about e-
book. But one aim this book can give many info for us. It is absolutely suitable. Right now, try to closer with
the book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for each other; you may share all of
these. Book FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday Cookbook has simple shape however, you
know: it has great and large function for you. You can search the enormous world by wide open and read a
e-book. So it is very wonderful.

Kathleen Elder:

Book is to be different for every single grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. As it
is known to us that book is very important for us. The book FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday
Cookbook had been making you to know about other know-how and of course you can take more
information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday
Cookbook is not only giving you considerably more new information but also to get your friend when you
sense bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship with all the
book FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday Cookbook. You never feel lose out for everything in
the event you read some books.

Carl Johnson:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or their
friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or playing video
games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read any book. It is
really fun to suit your needs. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent 24 hours a day to reading
a publication. The book FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun Food Holiday Cookbook it is very good to read.
There are a lot of people who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. When
you did not have enough space bringing this book you can buy the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to
read this book out of your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

George Hyler:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you actually, why because this FoodFest 365!: The Officially Fun
Food Holiday Cookbook guide written by well-known writer whose to say well how to make book which
might be understand by anyone who also read the book. Written within good manner for you, dripping every
ideas and publishing skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still doubt FoodFest 365!: The
Officially Fun Food Holiday Cookbook as good book not just by the cover but also by the content. This is



one publication that can break don't evaluate book by its deal with, so do you still needing a different sixth
sense to pick this!? Oh come on your reading through sixth sense already alerted you so why you have to
listening to one more sixth sense.
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