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Ten years ago Bill Gale of AT&T Bell Laboratories was primary organizer of the first Workshop on
Artificial Intelligence and Statistics. In the early days of the Workshop series it seemed clear that researchers
in AI and statistics had common interests, though with different emphases, goals, and vocabularies. In
learning and model selection, for example, a historical goal of AI to build autonomous agents probably
contributed to a focus on parameter-free learning systems, which relied little on an external analyst's
assumptions about the data. This seemed at odds with statistical strategy, which stemmed from a view that
model selection methods were tools to augment, not replace, the abilities of a human analyst. Thus,
statisticians have traditionally spent considerably more time exploiting prior information of the environment
to model data and exploratory data analysis methods tailored to their assumptions. In statistics, special
emphasis is placed on model checking, making extensive use of residual analysis, because all models are
'wrong', but some are better than others. It is increasingly recognized that AI researchers and/or AI programs
can exploit the same kind of statistical strategies to good effect. Often AI researchers and statisticians
emphasized different aspects of what in retrospect we might now regard as the same overriding tasks.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Bunch:

Book will be written, printed, or outlined for everything. You can know everything you want by a reserve.
Book has a different type. To be sure that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Next to that
you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication Learning from Data: Artificial Intelligence and
Statistics V (Lecture Notes in Statistics) will make you to always be smarter. You can feel more confidence
if you can know about every little thing. But some of you think which open or reading some sort of book
make you bored. It isn't make you fun. Why they might be thought like that? Have you trying to find best
book or suited book with you?

Ray Nicolas:

People live in this new moment of lifestyle always try and and must have the free time or they will get wide
range of stress from both everyday life and work. So , when we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you try this
one, reading guides. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, often the book you have
read is Learning from Data: Artificial Intelligence and Statistics V (Lecture Notes in Statistics).

Harry Fulford:

The book untitled Learning from Data: Artificial Intelligence and Statistics V (Lecture Notes in Statistics)
contain a lot of information on that. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very
clear and understandable all the people, so do definitely not worry, you can easy to read the idea. The book
was compiled by famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. You can read
this book because you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within
anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can start their official web-site and order it. Have
a nice go through.

Jose Crawford:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
your book. Book is prepared or printed or created from each source this filled update of news. In this
particular modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, novel and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Learning from Data: Artificial Intelligence and Statistics V (Lecture Notes in Statistics) when
you needed it?
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