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Exploring the steroid-fueled world of professional wrestling, this riveting chronicle lays bare the devastating
events that led to the 2007 murder-suicide of Chris Benoit, his wife Nancy, and their seven-year-old son,
Daniel. Benoit's performance-enhancing drug addiction—massive amounts of doctor-prescribed human
growth hormone were found in Benoit's home—and subsequent suicide proved to be the tipping point for the
professional wrestling world, resulting in unprecedented scrutiny of the sport's subpar health and safety
standards. Using public records, dozen of interviews with those inside and outside of wrestling, and
investigative results, this authoritative analysis provides an uncompromising look at the price athletes pay in
this rough-and-tumble world. The ebook edition includes a new introduction that looks at recent events in
sports, and further contextualizes the story of Chris Benoit and the figures surrounding his career
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From reader reviews:

Robert Landers:

This Chris & Nancy: The True Story of the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of Death
book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you
receive by reading this book is information inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get details which is
getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This Chris & Nancy: The True Story of
the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of Death without we recognize teach the one who
reading it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't always be worry Chris & Nancy: The True
Story of the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of Death can bring if you are and not make
your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full because you can have it in your lovely laptop even cell
phone. This Chris & Nancy: The True Story of the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of
Death having good arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not truly feel uninterested in reading.

Heidi Fritz:

Often the book Chris & Nancy: The True Story of the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail
of Death will bring someone to the new experience of reading a book. The author style to describe the idea is
very unique. When you try to find new book to learn, this book very ideal to you. The book Chris & Nancy:
The True Story of the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of Death is much recommended
to you you just read. You can also get the e-book through the official web site, so you can easier to read the
book.

Lavada Rowlett:

In this period globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make
someone to understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information easier
to share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon.
You will see that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended
for you is Chris & Nancy: The True Story of the Benoit Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of
Death this reserve consist a lot of the information with the condition of this world now. This particular book
was represented just how can the world has grown up. The language styles that writer use for explain it is
easy to understand. Typically the writer made some analysis when he makes this book. This is why this book
suited all of you.

Harry Thomas:

What is your hobby? Have you heard which question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher on their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. So you know
that little person like reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand that reading is
very important and book as to be the point. Book is important thing to provide you knowledge, except your



teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by book. Amount types of books
that can you take to be your object. One of them is actually Chris & Nancy: The True Story of the Benoit
Murder-Suicide and Pro Wrestling's Cocktail of Death.
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