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This title examines the role of political culture and penal populism in the response to the emotive subject of
child-on-child homicide.

Green explores the reasons underlying the vastly differing responses of the English and Norwegian criminal
justice systems to the cases of James Bulger and Silje Redergard respectively. Whereas James Bulger's
killers were subject to extreme press and public hostility, and held in secure detention for nine months before
being tried in an adversarial court, and served eight years in custody, a Redergard's killers were shielded
from public antagonism and carefully reintegrated into the local
community. This book argues that English adversarial political culture creates far more incentives to
politicize high-profile crimes than Norwegian consensus political culture. Drawing on a wealth of empirical
research, Green suggests that the tendency for politicians to justify punitive responses to
crime by invoking harsh political attitudes is based upon a flawed understanding of public opinion.

In a compelling study, Green proposes a more deliberative response to crime is possible by making English
culture less adversarial and by making informed public judgment more assessable.
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From reader reviews:

Barbara Clarke:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style within this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot
of information that may give you benefit in your life. With book everyone in this world can certainly share
their idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the story that share in the guides. But also they write about the
information about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your
kids, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors nowadays always try to improve their talent
in writing, they also doing some study before they write on their book. One of them is this When Children
Kill Children: Penal Populism and Political Culture (Clarendon Studies in Criminology).

Doris Moreno:

Reading a book for being new life style in this 12 months; every people loves to learn a book. When you
study a book you can get a large amount of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on
what forms of book that you have read. If you want to get information about your research, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself look for a fiction books, these kinds of us
novel, comics, as well as soon. The When Children Kill Children: Penal Populism and Political Culture
(Clarendon Studies in Criminology) provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Teresa Propst:

You may spend your free time you just read this book this guide. This When Children Kill Children: Penal
Populism and Political Culture (Clarendon Studies in Criminology) is simple to create you can read it in the
playground, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not include much space to bring the printed
book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your
smart phone. Thus there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Daniel Scholz:

Is it anyone who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day by means of watching television
programs or just telling lies on the bed? Do you need something new? This When Children Kill Children:
Penal Populism and Political Culture (Clarendon Studies in Criminology) can be the solution, oh how
comes? It's a book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is
common not a geek activity. So what these publications have than the others?
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