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It's 1978 in America's Finest City--San Diego, California--and one rookie cop is learning the hardest lessons
the streets have to teach.Luke Jones--a recently graduated, Shakespeare quoting literature major--is about to
discover that dealing with crooks is the easiest part of his new job. For here, in a world populated by people
ruled by their obsessions, Luke's strong will and quick tongue alienate many of his senior officers and he
must fight to be accepted. Although eventually labeled a hero, his success comes at great cost.The Sticking
Place is the first in the Luke Jones series, which follows one cop's career from rookie to retirement.
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From reader reviews:

Anthony Powell:

This The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones Novel) book is absolutely not ordinary book, you have after that it
the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book will be information inside this book
incredible fresh, you will get info which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of information you will get. This
kind of The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones Novel) without we understand teach the one who looking at it
become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't end up being worry The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones
Novel) can bring any time you are and not make your carrier space or bookshelves' turn out to be full
because you can have it within your lovely laptop even phone. This The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones
Novel) having great arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Owen Bourne:

This The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones Novel) tend to be reliable for you who want to be described as a
successful person, why. The reason of this The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones Novel) can be one of several
great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed an individual
with information that possibly will shock your earlier knowledge. This book will be handy, you can bring it
all over the place and whenever your conditions in e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this The Sticking
Place (A Luke Jones Novel) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for example rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

Ricardo Boddie:

Typically the book The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones Novel) has a lot associated with on it. So when you
read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was authored by the very famous author. Mcdougal makes
some research before write this book. This kind of book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily
after perusing this book.

Walter Reeves:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The publication lovers usually prefer to decide on book
like comic, short story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not seeking The Sticking Place (A
Luke Jones Novel) that give your fun preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading habit
all over the world can be said as the way for people to know world much better then how they react in the
direction of the world. It can't be said constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man or woman but
for all of you who wants to end up being success person. So , for every you who want to start reading as your
good habit, you can pick The Sticking Place (A Luke Jones Novel) become your starter.
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