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"The book is a good source for study-abroad professionals and has the ability to provide direction for
programs needing new life breathed into them, particularly at a time when budgets are shrinking, calls for
accountability are increasing, and students deserve, more than ever, to have truly meaningful study-abroad
experiences."?The Review of Higher Education

"Argues for the re-evaluation of longstanding assumptions and practices in study-abroad programs."?The
Chronicle of Higher Education

A central purpose of this book is to question the claims commonly made about the educational benefits of
study abroad.

Traditional metrics of enrollment increases and student self-report, and practices of structural immersion, are
being questioned as educators voice growing uncertainty about what students are or are not in fact learning
abroad. This book looks into whether these criticisms are justified—and what can be done if they are.

Student Learning Abroad reviews the dominant paradigms of study abroad; marshals rigorous research
findings, with emphasis on recent studies that offer convincing evidence about what undergraduates are or
are not learning; brings to bear the latest knowledge about human learning and development that raises
questions about the very foundations of current theory and practice; and presents six examples of study
abroad courses or programs whose interventions apply this knowledge.

This book prompts a re-consideration of long-held assumptions, beliefs and practices about teaching and
learning in study abroad and reexamination of the design and delivery of programs. In doing so, it provides a
foundation for responding to the question that many faculty and staff are now asking: What do I need to
know, and what do I need to be able to do, to help my students learn and develop more effectively abroad?
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Henderson:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or facts even knowledge to make
these keep up with the era that is always change and progress. Some of you maybe will update themselves by
studying books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to you actually is you don't know
what one you should start with. This Student Learning Abroad: What Our Students Are Learning, What
They're Not, and What We Can Do About It is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world.
Why, because book serves what you want and want in this era.

Patricia Baker:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family or their
friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching TV, as well as playing
video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity that is look different you can read any
book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent all day every day to reading a
reserve. The book Student Learning Abroad: What Our Students Are Learning, What They're Not, and What
We Can Do About It it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book.
These people were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to bring this book you
can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not
very costly but this book possesses high quality.

Fred Prentice:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always aim to and must have the extra time or they will get large
amount of stress from both way of life and work. So , whenever we ask do people have extra time, we will
say absolutely of course. People is human not a robot. Then we ask again, what kind of activity have you got
when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer will certainly unlimited right. Then do you
ever try this one, reading textbooks. It can be your alternative within spending your spare time, the book you
have read is usually Student Learning Abroad: What Our Students Are Learning, What They're Not, and
What We Can Do About It.

Jamie Durbin:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher for their students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby.
Therefore you know that little person just like reading or as reading become their hobby. You have to know
that reading is very important along with book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to incorporate you
knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You discover good news or update about something by
book. Different categories of books that can you choose to use be your object. One of them is actually
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