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Ahlia University contributes to the advancement and propagation of knowledge by encouraging its
academics and research students to publish their original research that can be applied to real-life situations.
Co-operation with Brunel University London in the United Kingdom led to the establishing of a Ph.D.
programme at Ahlia University in 2005.
An important annual feature of the programme is the two-day symposium held at Ahlia University at which
students are expected to give a presentation on their research to date. After the symposium, each
participating student records the contents of his/her presentation in a research paper.
?
This volume contains the proceedings of the workshop held in 2014. The majority of students carry out
research related to a wide variety of topics in business and management and this is reflected in this book.
Special feature of the contributions is the many original areas of application it covers that are related to the
Arab world. These include the banking sector, female entrepreneurship and leadership in corporate
boardrooms, healthcare, quality assurance, crisis management and business continuity in the oil sector, and
aspects of organization in secondary and higher education.
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From reader reviews:

Chris Robertson:

Book is actually written, printed, or created for everything. You can know everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As we know that book is important thing to bring us around the world. Close to
that you can your reading skill was fluently. A e-book Higher Education in the Twenty-First Century II will
make you to become smarter. You can feel far more confidence if you can know about everything. But some
of you think that will open or reading any book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun. Why
they might be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or acceptable book with you?

Adrian Rogers:

The reserve untitled Higher Education in the Twenty-First Century II is the e-book that recommended to you
to study. You can see the quality of the guide content that will be shown to a person. The language that
author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The article author was did a lot
of study when write the book, hence the information that they share to you personally is absolutely accurate.
You also could possibly get the e-book of Higher Education in the Twenty-First Century II from the
publisher to make you more enjoy free time.

Adam Schneider:

People live in this new day time of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the extra time or they will get
great deal of stress from both way of life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely indeed. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we request again, what kind of activity are
you experiencing when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever
try this one, reading guides. It can be your alternative inside spending your spare time, often the book you
have read is usually Higher Education in the Twenty-First Century II.

Robert Tanaka:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more precious than
other. Do you want to become considered one of it? It is just simple way to have that. What you have to do is
just spending your time almost no but quite enough to experience a look at some books. On the list of books
in the top collection in your reading list is actually Higher Education in the Twenty-First Century II. This
book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in getting precious person. By
looking right up and review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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