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My friends the children are responsible for this new "Oz Book," as they were for the last one, which was
called The Land of Oz. Their sweet little letters plead to know "more about Dorothy"; and they ask: "What
became of the Cowardly Lion?" and "What did Ozma do afterward?"—meaning, of course, after she became
the Ruler of Oz. And some of them suggest plots to me, saying: "Please have Dorothy go to the Land of Oz
again"; or, "Why don't you make Ozma and Dorothy meet, and have a good time together?" Indeed, could I
do all that my little friends ask, I would be obliged to write dozens of books to satisfy their demands. And I
wish I could, for I enjoy writing these stories just as much as the children say they enjoy reading them.
Well, here is "more about Dorothy," and about our old friends the Scarecrow and the Tin Woodman, and
about the Cowardly Lion, and Ozma, and all the rest of them; and here, likewise, is a good deal about some
new folks that are queer and unusual. One little friend, who read this story before it was printed, said to me:
"Billina is real Ozzy, Mr. Baum, and so are Tiktok and the Hungry Tiger."
If this judgment is unbiased and correct, and the little folks find this new story "real Ozzy," I shall be very
glad indeed that I wrote it. But perhaps I shall get some more of those very welcome letters from my readers,
telling me just how they like "Ozma of Oz." I hope so, anyway.
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From reader reviews:

Sadie McBride:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing for
us to be aware of everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that e-
book has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time and energy to read a book. These
are reading whatever they take because their hobby is actually reading a book. What about the person who
don't like reading a book? Sometime, man feel need book when they found difficult problem or exercise.
Well, probably you'll have this Ozma of Oz.

Karolyn Kaufman:

Here thing why that Ozma of Oz are different and trusted to be yours. First of all reading a book is good
nonetheless it depends in the content from it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Ozma of Oz
giving you information deeper and in different ways, you can find any book out there but there is no book
that similar with Ozma of Oz. It gives you thrill studying journey, its open up your current eyes about the
thing this happened in the world which is perhaps can be happened around you. You can easily bring
everywhere like in park your car, café, or even in your way home by train. In case you are having difficulties
in bringing the published book maybe the form of Ozma of Oz in e-book can be your alternate.

Eulalia Perry:

That guide can make you to feel relax. This particular book Ozma of Oz was colorful and of course has
pictures on the website. As we know that book Ozma of Oz has many kinds or category. Start from kids until
teenagers. For example Naruto or Detective Conan you can read and believe you are the character on there.
Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it makes you feel happy, fun and chill out. Try to
choose the best book in your case and try to like reading this.

Julie Gooch:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from the book. Book is written or printed or created from each source that will filled update of news. On this
modern era like at this point, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media
social including newspaper, magazines, science e-book, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
trying to find the Ozma of Oz when you needed it?
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