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El Arte de la Guerra es el mejor libro de estrategia de todos los tiempos. Inspiró a Napoleón, Maquiavelo,
Mao Tse Tung y muchas más figuras históricas. Este libro de dos quinientos mil años de antigüedad, es uno
de los más importantes textos clásicos chinos, en el que, a pesar del tiempo transcurrido, ninguna de sus
máximas ha quedado anticuada, ni hay un solo consejo que hoy no sea útil. Pero la obra del general Sun Tzu
no es únicamente un libro de práctica militar, sino un tratado que enseña la estrategia suprema de aplicar con
sabiduría el conocimiento de la naturaleza humana en los momentos de confrontación. No es, por tanto, un
libro sobre la guerra; es una obra para comprender las raíces de un conflicto y buscar una solución. "la mejor
victoria es vencer sin combatir", nos dice Sun Tzu, "y ésa es la distinción entre le hombre prudente y el
ignorante".
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From reader reviews:

Lucia Morrone:

Book is usually written, printed, or highlighted for everything. You can understand everything you want by a
guide. Book has a different type. As it is known to us that book is important point to bring us around the
world. Alongside that you can your reading expertise was fluently. A publication El Arte de la Guerra
(Spanish Edition) will make you to end up being smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you
can know about every thing. But some of you think that open or reading any book make you bored. It is not
make you fun. Why they can be thought like that? Have you in search of best book or ideal book with you?

Jesse Valles:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world likes. Do you like reading book
and so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoy it. First reading a book will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a reserve you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or even their idea. Second, studying a book will make an individual more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this El
Arte de la Guerra (Spanish Edition), you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours e-
book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a reserve.

Jacqueline Kang:

Is it anyone who having spare time and then spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This El Arte de la Guerra (Spanish Edition) can
be the respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are consequently out of date, spending your
spare time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the
others?

Lavonne Ouellette:

In this particular era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more
special than other. Do you want to become one of it? It is just simple strategy to have that. What you must do
is just spending your time not much but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of several books
in the top collection in your reading list is definitely El Arte de la Guerra (Spanish Edition). This book that is
qualified as The Hungry Slopes can get you closer in becoming precious person. By looking way up and
review this e-book you can get many advantages.
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