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This book effectively challenges the conventional wisdom regarding the cluster-innovation relationship and
provides convincing evidence to show that the prevailing theoretical models derived from Anglo–American
experiences cannot be uncritically applied to Chinese reality. This book introduces a new theory of state-firm
coordination to explain why and how some Chinese ICT firms have turned out to be more innovative than
others. Perspectives from the viewpoint of economic geography, institutional economics, political science,
and regulation theory have been provided to throw light on the enigma that is China's ICT industry.
Empirically, the book provides state-of-the-art findings to clarify the confusion and misunderstanding about
the exact nature of the ICT industry in China. This book has essentially set a new baseline and made
definitive contribution to knowledge production about China's economic geography. Methodologically, it
shows how original, critical, and independent research can be undertaken effectively and innovatively
through cross-disciplinary theoretical interaction, deductive reasoning with hypotheses testing, combination
of multiple means of data collection; integration of quantitative and qualitative methods; and structured
presentation of research findings with extensive tabular, graphic, and cartographic illustrations.

Contents:

Introduction●

Interpreting Technological Innovation Through Industrial Clustering●

Understanding China's Technological Innovation Through State-Firm Strategic Coordination●

The Geography of Technological Innovation in China's ICT Industry●

State-Firm Strategic Coordination and the Growth of the Integrated Circuit Design Industry in Shanghai●

State-Firm Strategic Coordination and the Growth of the ICT Industry in Shenzhen●

State-Firm Strategic Coordination and Technological Innovation in Shanghai and Shenzhen: A●

Comparative Study
Conclusion●

Readership: Undergraduates, graduates, researchers and professionals who are interested in China's
economic geography and technological innovation. Business Schools, economics departments, and
consultant firms with special interest in microeconomics will find the book beneficial and inspiring.
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From reader reviews:

Patrick Cartwright:

With other case, little persons like to read book Upgrading China's Information and Communication
Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic Coordination and the Geography of Technological Innovation.
You can choose the best book if you want reading a book. Given that we know about how is important a
book Upgrading China's Information and Communication Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic
Coordination and the Geography of Technological Innovation. You can add know-how and of course you
can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, mainly because from book you can recognize everything!
From your country right up until foreign or abroad you may be known. About simple thing until wonderful
thing you may know that. In this era, we are able to open a book or maybe searching by internet device. It is
called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

Ruth Coleman:

This Upgrading China's Information and Communication Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic
Coordination and the Geography of Technological Innovation is great guide for you because the content
which can be full of information for you who have always deal with world and get to make decision every
minute. This specific book reveal it details accurately using great manage word or we can say no rambling
sentences inside. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only
provides straight forward sentences but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having
Upgrading China's Information and Communication Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic Coordination
and the Geography of Technological Innovation in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, facts in it
is not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that offer you world inside ten or fifteen small right but this
publication already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey there Mr. and Mrs. occupied do you
still doubt that?

Wanda Holmes:

Reading a book for being new life style in this yr; every people loves to read a book. When you read a book
you can get a lot of benefit. When you read books, you can improve your knowledge, since book has a lot of
information on it. The information that you will get depend on what types of book that you have read. In
order to get information about your study, you can read education books, but if you want to entertain
yourself you are able to a fiction books, this sort of us novel, comics, as well as soon. The Upgrading China's
Information and Communication Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic Coordination and the Geography
of Technological Innovation provide you with new experience in looking at a book.

Russell Howell:

Do you like reading a guide? Confuse to looking for your chosen book? Or your book had been rare? Why so



many problem for the book? But just about any people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
studying, not only science book but novel and Upgrading China's Information and Communication
Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic Coordination and the Geography of Technological Innovation or
even others sources were given expertise for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel
would like to read more and more. Science book was created for teacher or even students especially. Those
textbooks are helping them to include their knowledge. In additional case, beside science e-book, any other
book likes Upgrading China's Information and Communication Technology Industry:State-Firm Strategic
Coordination and the Geography of Technological Innovation to make your spare time much more colorful.
Many types of book like this.
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