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A unique anthology of avian literature

From the myths of ancient Greece to the fables of Aesop, from Chaucer to contemporary poetry and fiction,
birds are central to literature because they connect us intimately to the natural world. Whether we watch
birds at our feeders, travel vast distances to identify rare species, or simply pause in a busy day to listen to
the coo of a dove or the trill of a warbler, birds sustain us.

Birds in the Hand is a collection of contemporary fiction and poetry that explores the complex, often
startling ways in which birds shed light upon our lives. In work from a diverse and celebrated group of
contemporary authors such as Charles Baxter, T.C. Boyle, Jim Harrison, Flannery O'Connor, Pattiann
Rogers, Seamus Heaney, Derek Walcott, Ethan Canin, and Jorie Graham, birds are sources of inspiration,
confrontation, and revelation.

These stories and poems take us from New York and Hoboken to the Salton Sea and the wilds of Montana,
from a hardware store to the westernmost Aleutian island, from a prison to marshes, forests, and seacoasts.

Field guides and natural history books cannot capture the essence of why birds thrill us. Birds in the Hand
uses the vitality and nuance of fiction and poetry to get at the heart of our mysterious sense of birds and the
way they can reflect the brightest and darkest aspects of our own natures.
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From reader reviews:

Henry Knight:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have more or little spare time? Yes, you can
choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent their own spare time to take a walk,
shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or read a book called Birds in the Hand: Fiction and
Poetry About Birds? Maybe it is being best activity for you. You understand beside you can spend your time
together with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have
some other opinion?

Margaret Pinson:

This Birds in the Hand: Fiction and Poetry About Birds are generally reliable for you who want to become a
successful person, why. The reason of this Birds in the Hand: Fiction and Poetry About Birds can be one of
many great books you must have is giving you more than just simple looking at food but feed you actually
with information that perhaps will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can
bring it almost everywhere and whenever your conditions both in e-book and printed versions. Beside that
this Birds in the Hand: Fiction and Poetry About Birds forcing you to have an enormous of experience for
instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day
task. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Shalon Fisk:

Reading a book to be new life style in this yr; every people loves to study a book. When you read a book you
can get a lots of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge, due to the fact book
has a lot of information into it. The information that you will get depend on what sorts of book that you have
read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read education books, but if you act like
you want to entertain yourself you are able to a fiction books, such us novel, comics, and also soon. The
Birds in the Hand: Fiction and Poetry About Birds provide you with a new experience in examining a book.

Ana Jimenez:

Many people said that they feel bored stiff when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item
when they get a half parts of the book. You can choose the actual book Birds in the Hand: Fiction and Poetry
About Birds to make your own personal reading is interesting. Your personal skill of reading proficiency is
developing when you such as reading. Try to choose very simple book to make you enjoy to learn it and
mingle the opinion about book and studying especially. It is to be initial opinion for you to like to open a
book and study it. Beside that the e-book Birds in the Hand: Fiction and Poetry About Birds can to be your
new friend when you're sense alone and confuse with what must you're doing of these time.
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