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When good cupids go bad...

Carissa Langston is a perfectly lovely woman, so she can't figure out why she's always been single. The
higher ups at Cupid Headquarters are wondering the same thing.

What none of them knows is that Quincy, her assigned cupid, fancies himself in love with her. He doesn't
think anyone will ever be good enough for her--especially not that James "Hutch" Hutchington person. Who
cares if the man is really Carissa's soul mate?

When Carissa and Hutch run into one another after years apart, sparks fly. Quincy does some fancy cupiding
to keep them apart--no matter the cost. Can Carissa and Hutch thwart cupid and reach their happily ever
after?

WARNING: Cupid hijinks, sexy chemistry between soul mates, and adult content.
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From reader reviews:

Calvin Baker:

A lot of people always spent all their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Did you know? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
playing video games all day long. In order to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read a
new book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the whole day to reading
a e-book. The book Thwarting Cupid it is extremely good to read. There are a lot of people that
recommended this book. They were enjoying reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space
to develop this book you can buy typically the e-book. You can m0ore very easily to read this book from the
smart phone. The price is not to cover but this book offers high quality.

Richard Daniels:

You can spend your free time to study this book this reserve. This Thwarting Cupid is simple to create you
can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train in addition to soon. If you did not get much space to
bring typically the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you simpler to read it. You can
save typically the book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this
book.

Randall Wilmes:

Is it anyone who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just lying
down on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Thwarting Cupid can be the answer, oh how
comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending your time by reading in this brand-new era is
common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the others?

Sandra Black:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everyone has different hobby. And also you
know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to understand that
reading is very important and book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge,
except your own personal teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update regarding something by book.
Different categories of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra Thwarting
Cupid.
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