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Author: Larry Lyons Publisher: GLOBE PEQUOT ( THE LYONS PRESS, FALCON), Feb 2006 Binding:
Hardcover ISBN: 1-59228-742-5 Synopsis Now, the book that every gun owner has been waiting for. Topics
covered include: work area, lighting, bore cleaning eqip & procedures, solvents, lubricants, rust prevention,
action cleaning, & much more. B&W photos & illus; 6x9 inches, 320 pgs. More Information A gun is only
as good as its owner, and far too many are poorly maintained and serviced, even when taken to
?professionals.? For the serious hunter and gun owner, THE GUN OWNER?S HANDBOOK takes the
mystery out of gun maintenance.Topics covered include: . Your Work Area . Lighting . Tool Storage .
Screwdrivers * Bore Cleaning Equipment and Procedures . Solvents . Lubricants. Rust Prevention . Action
Cleaning, Lubrication, and Inspection. Exterior Maintenance . Caring for Wood Stocks . Caring for Synthetic
Stocks . Scopes . Scope Mounts . Open Sights . Slings . Holsters. Cases . Misfiring . Sticky Actions . Stuck
Cartridges . Jamming. Poor Accuracy . Rough Trigger Pulls . Preparing for Trips . Field Repairs. Repair
KitsWith advice on inspecting barrels, disassembling safeties, repairing pumps and semi-automatics,
removing rust, caring for damaged stock, and much, much more, THE GUN OWNER?S HANDBOOK will
find a place on every gun owner?s shelf, and pay for itself almost immediately.ABOUT THE
AUTHOR:LARRY LYONS was born in Dowagiac, Michigan, home of the Niedner Rifle Company. He
built his first custom rifle at age thirteen and started a wholesale gunstock business at age twenty; since then,
he?s been a licensed, practicing gunsmith for thirty-five years. He had a long-running gunsmithing column
for Guns & Ammo magazine and a general firearms column for Michigan-Out-Of-Doors; he has also been
published in Muzzle Blast, Muzzle Loader, Outdoor Life, and several other magazines. He now lives in
Michigan where he is a forest fire fighter, gunsmith, and freelance writer.
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From reader reviews:

Christy Brodersen:

What do you ponder on book? It is just for students since they're still students or it for all people in the
world, the actual best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that issue above. Every person has
different personality and hobby for each and every other. Don't to be pressured someone or something that
they don't need do that. You must know how great along with important the book The Gun Owner's
Handbook: A Complete Guide to Maintaining and Repairing Your Firearms--in the Field or at Your
Workbench. All type of book could you see on many sources. You can look for the internet sources or other
social media.

Alyssa Lewis:

This The Gun Owner's Handbook: A Complete Guide to Maintaining and Repairing Your Firearms--in the
Field or at Your Workbench is great guide for you because the content and that is full of information for you
who always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. This specific book reveal it details
accurately using great manage word or we can say no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read the idea
hurriedly you can have whole information in it. Doesn't mean it only will give you straight forward sentences
but tough core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having The Gun Owner's Handbook: A
Complete Guide to Maintaining and Repairing Your Firearms--in the Field or at Your Workbench in your
hand like keeping the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous just one. We can say that no guide that
offer you world in ten or fifteen small right but this e-book already do that. So , this can be good reading
book. Hello Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt that?

Pearl Moore:

The book untitled The Gun Owner's Handbook: A Complete Guide to Maintaining and Repairing Your
Firearms--in the Field or at Your Workbench contain a lot of information on the item. The writer explains the
woman idea with easy means. The language is very straightforward all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read this. The book was compiled by famous author. The author provides you in the new
period of literary works. You can actually read this book because you can read more your smart phone, or
device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book,
you can start their official web-site and also order it. Have a nice go through.

Eileen Schmitt:

You can spend your free time to read this book this publication. This The Gun Owner's Handbook: A
Complete Guide to Maintaining and Repairing Your Firearms--in the Field or at Your Workbench is simple
to bring you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much space to bring the
particular printed book, you can buy the e-book. It is make you much easier to read it. You can save the
particular book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this



book.
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